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ITEMS 
(15) 

 All Western Evergreen 
Nursery & Christmas 
Tree Farm 
6840 Liberty Pole Rd 
PO Box 217 
Springwater, NY 14560 

Villani’s Lawn & 
Landscape, LLC 
6405 Packard Road 
Niagara Falls, NY 
14304 

Beau Enterprises, Inc. 
4250 Williams Road 
Ransomville, NY 
14131 

KJ Smith  
3616 Highland Ave. 
Niagara Falls, NY 
14305 

Schichtel’s 
Nursery 
7420 Peters Road 
Springville, NY 
14141-9405 

1. Red Maple: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 256.00 180.00 191.00 101.00 

 Red Maple: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 385.00 461.00 N/A 

2. Sugar Maple: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 256.00 180.00 191.00 101.00 

 Sugar Maple: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 385.00 461.00 N/A 

3. Yellow Birch: Purchase Price  
 

NO BID 270.00 215.00 230.00 115.00 

 Yellow Birch: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 400.00 551.00 N/A 

4. Shagbark Hickory: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 368.00 600.00 650.00 184.00 

 Shagbark Hickory: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 800.00 1,520.00 N/A 

5. American Beech: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 438.00 265.00 287.00 150.00 

 American Beech: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 465.00 683.00 N/A 

6. Black Walnut: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 306.00 210.00 218.00 153.00 

 Black Walnut: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 400.00 524.00 N/A 

7. Sycamore: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 256.00 180.00 191.00 101.00 

 Sycamore: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 385.00 461.00 N/A 
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ITEMS 
(15) 

 All Western Evergreen 
Nursery & Xmas Tree 
Farm  

Villani’s Lawn & 
Landscape, LLC 
 

Beau Enterprises, Inc. KJ Smith  
 

Schichtel’s 
Nursery 
 

8. Black Cherry: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 280.00 220.00 232.00 153.00 

 Black Cherry: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 400.00 557.00 N/A 

9. Red Oak: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 286.00 180.00 191.00 112.00 

 Red Oak: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 385.00 461.00 N/A 

10. White Oak: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 306.00 210.00 219.00 119.00 

 White Oak: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 400.00 527.00 N/A 

11. Basswood: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 252.00 240.00 258.00 99.00 

 Basswood: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 440.00 617.00 N/A 

12. Tulip Tree: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 280.00 180.00 188.00 99.00 

 Tulip Tree: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 385.00 455.00 N/A 

13 White Spruce: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 176.00 110.00 109.00 71.00 

 White Spruce: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 310.00 272.00 N/A 

14. White Pine: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 166.00 110.00 95.00 71.00 

 White Pine: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 310.00 236.00 N/A 

15. Eastern Hemlock: Purchase Price 
 

NO BID 176.00 110.00 98.00 71.00 

 Eastern Hemlock: Planting Price 
 

NO BID 250.00 310.00 245.00 N/A 
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ITEMS 
(15) 

 Wayside Nursery, Inc. 
8962 Porter Road 
Niagara Falls, NY 
14304 

XXX XXX XXX XXX 

1. Red Maple: Purchase Price 
 

145.00     

 Red Maple: Planting Price 
 

200.00     

2. Sugar Maple: Purchase Price 
 

155.00     

 Sugar Maple: Planting Price 
 

220.00     

3. Yellow Birch: Purchase Price  
 

195.00     

 Yellow Birch: Planting Price 
 

240.00     

4. Shagbark Hickory: Purchase Price 
 

295.00     

 Shagbark Hickory: Planting Price 
 

290.00     

5. American Beech: Purchase Price 
 

270.00     

 American Beech: Planting Price 
 

270.00     

6. Black Walnut: Purchase Price 
 

195.00     

 Black Walnut: Planting Price 
 

240.00     

7. Sycamore: Purchase Price 
 

170.00     

 Sycamore: Planting Price 
 

225.00     
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ITEMS 
(15) 

 Wayside Nursery, Inc. XXX XXX XXX XXX 

8. Black Cherry: Purchase Price 
 

195.00     

 Black Cherry: Planting Price 
 

240.00     

9. Red Oak: Purchase Price 
 

185.00     

 Red Oak: Planting Price 
 

230.00     

10. White Oak: Purchase Price 
 

195.00     

 White Oak: Planting Price 
 

240.00     

11. Basswood: Purchase Price 
 

180.00     

 Basswood: Planting Price 
 

215.00     

12. Tulip Tree: Purchase Price 
 

180.00     

 Tulip Tree: Planting Price 
 

215.00     

13 White Spruce: Purchase Price 
 

105.00     

 White Spruce: Planting Price 
 

190.00     

14. White Pine: Purchase Price 
 

100.00     

 White Pine: Planting Price 
 

210.00     

15. Eastern Hemlock: Purchase Price 
 

100.00     

 Eastern Hemlock: Planting Price 
 

210.00     

 


